
From: Andrew Kinney
To: Scott Boettcher
Cc: Tim Rubert; Cynthia Wilson; Sandy Eccker; Jeremy Davis; colronjanaverill@comcast.net
Subject: RE: Clarifying Information Needs -- RE: Grant Application
Date: Monday, July 16, 2018 11:22:38 AM

Scott – The structures are from a list developed by French Wetmore, two are in Grays Harbor (very
close to the line).  All values are from Assessor’s data and may be a little out of date.
 
Parcel Number Address Proposed Action
14626310600 12717 Hunter Rd Elevate                                $105,100.00
14635430100 12501 HWY 12 Elevate                                   $139,600.00
14635420100 12425 HWY 12 Elevate                                   $156,800.00
14635440100 Moon Rd & HWY 12 Elevate                           $ 75,600.00                
17612 SW 175th Elevate                                                        $262,400.00
17633 SW 175th Elevate                                                         Actually in Grays Harbor
County
12935 SW 175th Elevate                                                         $149,600.00
15946 SW 175th Elevate                                                         Actually in Grays Harbor
County
12638 SW 175th Elevate                                                        
$142,200.00                                                   
13506340400 10910 Independence Rd SW Buy out             $ 71,500.00
13506330100 10940 Independence Rd SW Buy out             $ 24,800.00
13506330000 11020 Independence Rd SW Buy out             $173,800.00
47301000200 13134 HWY 12 Buy out                                   $ 12,800.00
14501340100 11810 Independence Rd SW Buy out             $270,800.00
14512210100 11841 Independence Rd SW Buy out             $ 85,900.00
Checking address – 201st Elevate                                          $ 75,000.00 approximately
Checking address – 201st Elevate                                          $ 75,000.00 approximately
Checking address – 201st Elevate                                          $ 75,000.00 approximately
12648 Independence Rd SW Buy out                                    $ 78,300.00
 
Thurston County experiences flooding and flood losses in five major river systems, standing
water flooding in the prairie areas, marine coastal and lake flooding.  We utilize mitigation
grants from FEMA, both HMPG and PDM; grants from Ecology, both FCAAP and
Floodplains by Design; HUD community block grants; and Cooperating Technical Partners
grants in addition to Flood Authority grants.  Presently Thurston County is elevating two
structures in the Deschutes watershed using a HMP grant.  Currently the Flood Authority is
the only program accepting proposals. 
 
Andrew
 
 
Andrew J. Kinney
Thurston County Emergency Management
9521 Tilley Rd S
Olympia WA 98512
kinneya@co.thurston.wa.us
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Office: 360.867.2827
 
 

From: Scott Boettcher [mailto:scottb@sbgh-partners.com] 
Sent: Monday, July 16, 2018 7:24 AM
To: Andrew Kinney <KinneyA@co.thurston.wa.us>
Cc: Tim Rubert <rubert@co.thurston.wa.us>; Cynthia Wilson <cynthia.wilson@co.thurston.wa.us>;
Sandy Eccker <ecckers@co.thurston.wa.us>; Jeremy Davis <jeremy.davis@co.thurston.wa.us>;
colronjanaverill@comcast.net
Subject: Clarifying Information Needs -- RE: Grant Application
 
Andrew – A few clarifying information needs from our 2019-21 local projects reviewing team re
your proposed project (https://www.ezview.wa.gov/DesktopModules/Documents2/View.aspx?
tabID=28124&alias=1492&mid=69498&ItemID=6167):

1.       Can you please reply back (“reply all”) with any information you can assemble
regarding the individual value of each the homes/properties (TC Assessor, etc.)
proposed for elevation (table of values for each property would be great).

2.      Have you looked at other funding programs (e.g., FEMA)?  If so what did you find?
3.       Can you send final report for previously funded home elevation project

(https://secure.rco.wa.gov/prism/search/ProjectSnapshot.aspx?ProjectNumber=17-
1010).

 

Thanks for your help.  Please get back to me by the end of the day July 20th at the latest.
 
Thanks again.
 
Scott
 
Scott Boettcher, Staff
Chehalis River Basin Flood Authority
360/480-6600
scottb@sbgh-partners.com
 
 
 
 

From: Scott Boettcher 
Sent: Tuesday, July 3, 2018 7:25 AM
To: Andrew Kinney <KinneyA@co.thurston.wa.us>
Cc: Tim Rubert <rubert@co.thurston.wa.us>; Cynthia Wilson <cynthia.wilson@co.thurston.wa.us>;
Sandy Eccker <ecckers@co.thurston.wa.us>; Jeremy Davis <jeremy.davis@co.thurston.wa.us>;
colronjanaverill@comcast.net
Subject: RE: Grant Application
 
Thank you Andrew.  Your proposal has been rec’d on time.
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Scott
 
Scott Boettcher, Staff
Chehalis River Basin Flood Authority
360/480-6600
scottb@sbgh-partners.com
 
 
 
 

From: Andrew Kinney <KinneyA@co.thurston.wa.us> 
Sent: Monday, July 2, 2018 2:00 PM
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>
Cc: Tim Rubert <rubert@co.thurston.wa.us>; Cynthia Wilson <cynthia.wilson@co.thurston.wa.us>;
Sandy Eccker <ecckers@co.thurston.wa.us>; Jeremy Davis <jeremy.davis@co.thurston.wa.us>
Subject: Grant Application
 
Scott – Attached is a placeholder application to continue Thurston County’s program to elevate or
buy out structures within floodways and floodplains in the Chehalis Basin.  I’m expecting the County
to grant permission for an official application by the end of July.  I’ll keep you posted.  Site selection
has gotten easier because homeowners are understanding the process and like the work being
completed.  Thurston County now maintains a list of property owners that wish to participate. 
 
Please contact me if you need any additional information.  Thank you for this opportunity to
continue our program.  Andrew
 
 
 
Andrew J. Kinney
Thurston County Emergency Management
9521 Tilley Rd S
Olympia WA 98512
kinneya@co.thurston.wa.us
Office: 360.867.2827
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