


































































































June 23, 2022
FRY CREEK PUMP STATION

2021-2023 MID BUDGET REVIEW REQUEST
Page 2 of 2

regionally significant flood damage reduction project. The revised bid opening is scheduled for
July 6, and we intend to celebrate this project reaching the construction phase with state, local,
and congressional leaders on July 7. Our intent is to award a construction contract at the next
Council meeting and physical construction work should begin in August. Even with our current
funding gap, implementation of the Chehalis Basin Strategy through completion of our large-
scale measures remains a critical priority to both Aberdeen and Hoquiam.

Critical infrastructure improvements of the Aberdeen Hoquiam Flood Protection Project to
provide both flood protection and restoration of aquatic species would not be positioned for
success if not for the continued support of the Office of Chehalis Basin. The Office of Chehalis
Basin has previously allocated over $17.5 million dollars to Aberdeen-Hoquiam projects. We
have been good stewards of these funds, spending them down in a timely fashion and wisely
retaining funds for construction where appropriate. Of the previous allocations, approximately
$4,167,000 has been used in preliminary design for the North Shore Levee, approximately
$1,047,000 has been used for design of the Fry Creek Pump Station, and we have held
$7,740,000 for construction of the Fry Creek Pump Station. An additional $4,600,000 was also
allocated to the City of Hoquiam for Design of the North Shore Levee West. Both the North
Shore Levee and North Shore Levee West will be in position for construction funding in the
2023-25 biennium. We have worked diligently to advance these projects and anticipate spending
down all currently appropriated funds within the current biennium.

We hope there can be some grace and understanding given the existing market conditions every
project is dealing with while we work to complete this first step of our regional flood protection
focus. Any additional funds allocated by the Officie of Chehalis Basin Board will immediately
be utilized in our critical flood protection project and will be spent within 12 months.

We look forward to a continued partnership with the Office of Chehalis Basin as we work to
complete this initial segment and work towards future segments of our large scale flood damage
reduction measures. Building on the success of the Fry Creek Pump Station request, we will be
requesting additional funds in the 2023-25 biennium for future elements of the flood reduction
plan.

Thank you for your consideration and should you need any additional information, please feel
free to let us know.

Sincerely,
City of Aberdeen

Nicholas D. Bird, P.E.
City Engineer

CC: STORM-2018-0002

Electronic Folder: [X:\~Projects\STORM\STORM-2018-0002 Fry Creek Pump Station\100 Financial\130 Funding Applications]
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Scott Boettcher

From: Scott Boettcher
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 7:26 AM
To: Scott Boettcher
Subject: FW: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities 

for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds
Attachments: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 

"Reserve" Funds

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 1:06 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Cool, then Andrea is supportive.  
 

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 12:56 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
I think the $20K was an earlier conceptual number.  What was submitted on the request form was $35K.  See attached. 
Scott 
 

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 12:39 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Hey – Andrea’s asking why the $20K turned to $35K. Is it just an oversight or is there something substantively different 
in terms of what’s being proposed to purchase and install? 
 

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 7:56 AM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Ok.  Thanks.  Note: Fully funding the $35K request ensures the new China Creek gage will be installed, operational and 
tied-in to the Flood Warning System in time for this coming flood season.  Note Also: Attached shows National Weather 
Service will add the new gage to their HADS system effectively allowing their weather forecast to consume real-time 
data from the gage (telemetry).  This will only improve their forecast. 
Scott 
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From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 7:47 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: Re: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Talking to Andrea today at 1130. She was on vacation all last week.  
 
Sent from my T-Mobile 5G Device 
Get Outlook for Android 

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 7:45:59 AM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds  
  
Ken – Any update on this? 
Scott 
  

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2022 9:23 AM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Thanks Ken!  Look forward to hearing back. 
Scott 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2022 9:16 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: RE: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Thanks, Scott. Let me look into this and will try to get back to you in a day or two. I’m slammed with meetings. My initial 
sense is that given the Board approved opening up the full reserve the added $15K isn’t going to be an issue to fund.  
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2022 3:03 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: FW: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for 
Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
Importance: High 
  
Hi Ken.  I realized my Friday email contained wrong attachment regarding Centralia gage.  Correct one attached 
now.  Please let me know about the $35K. 
Scott 
  

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Friday, July 8, 2022 7:06 AM 
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To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: China Creek Gage Funding Question -- FW: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting 
Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Ken – At yesterday’s CBB meeting the new China Creek Gage was described as $20,000.  In actuality the cost is 
$35,000.  See attached and below.  How much of a deal is it to secure the full $35,000?  If its problematic to secure the 
remaining $15,000 then I’ll figure something else out.  Just wanted to ask.  Thanks, and good job pulling everything 
together at the last minute.  And again, I’m sorry if I was a bottleneck along the way.  Let me know.  Thanks. 
Scott 
  
  

Sponsor Project Request Request 

Complete 
Project by 
June 30, 
2023 

Paybac
Project
and/or 
Whole 

Centralia China Creek Floodwater Storage and Fish Habitat Project $ 643,000   $ 643,000  Yes Ye

Cosmopolis Mill Creek Multi‐Objective Implementation Plan, Phase II $    25,000   $    25,000  Yes n/

Port of 
Chehalis 

Berwick Creek Flood Reduction and Restoration $     89,257   $     89,257  
No Ye

Flood 
Authority 

New China Creek Gage $    20,000   $    35,000  
Yes n/

    $    777,257   $   792,257      

  
  

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 8:36 AM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: VRaines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us; Andrea McNamara Doyle <Andrea.Doyle@ecy.wa.gov> 
Subject: RE: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" 
Funds 
  
Here’s last. 
Scott 
  

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 7:40 AM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: VRaines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us; Andrea McNamara Doyle <Andrea.Doyle@ecy.wa.gov> 
Subject: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
Importance: High 
  
Ken – Attached are 4 forms for you.  Just got some outstanding information for the Haul Road request form.  I’ll have 
that last form to you shortly.  Table 1 tallies Flood Authority funding request.  I did not include $75K for 2017 Basin Gage 
Master Plan update as I understood from you that that would be funded through OCB request.  Correct? 
Scott 
  

Table 1 

Immediate Funding (7/07/2022 CBB Request) 
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Sponsor Project Request Complete 
Project By 
June 30, 
2023 

Payback 
Project 
and/or 
Make Whole 

Finish, 
Complete, 
Close Project 
(or Distinct 
Phase) 

Centralia China Creek Floodwater 
Storage and Fish Habitat 
Project 

$        643,000  

Yes Yes Yes 

Cosmopolis Mill Creek Multi‐
Objective 
Implementation Plan, 
Phase II 

$          25,000  

Yes n/a Yes 

Flood Authority New China Creek Gage $           35,000  Yes n/a Yes 

Port of Chehalis Berwick Creek Flood 
Reduction and 
Restoration 

$           89,257  
No Yes No 

Port of Grays 
Harbor 

Haul Road Immediate 
Protection Project 

$       400,000  
Yes n/a Yes 

    $     1,192,257        

  
  

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:09 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: VRaines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us; Andrea McNamara Doyle <Andrea.Doyle@ecy.wa.gov> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Sending again.  See attached. 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:07 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
I didn’t see a summary from you this morning, please send. And first thing tomorrow morning would be great for the 
attachments. Thanks 
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:02 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Its going to be first thing in a.m. tomorrow.  I have evening flood Authority meeting in Pe Ell.  Was my summary I sent 
you this morning helpful.  I’m sorry if I’m a bottle neck. 
Scott 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:00 PM 
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To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Hi Scott, we’re still waiting on your write-ups on the attachments for the 21-23 reserve funds for the Haul Road project 
and 3 Flood Authority projects. We can’t send the memo to the Board until we have those. Please let us know when 
we’ll get them.  
  
Thanks, 
Ken 
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 2:32 PM 
To: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov>; Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: Re: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Getting close.  Probably tomorrow. 

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 2:17:17 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds  
  
Thanks. Did you get a final budget estimate on the Haul Road project needs too? 
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 12:11 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Ken – Projects Committee met today and has developed a recommendation for the Flood Authority’s Executive 
Committee.  Following Executive committee review and approval, I’ll transmit formal request to OCB.  I’m trying to get 
all wrapped by end of this week. 
Scott 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 11:40 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Hi Scott, 
  
It would be best to get the attachment back by early next week; the goal is to have something together at least a week 
in advance of the meeting on the 7th. 
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Thanks, 
Ken 
  
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 8:34 AM 
To: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us>; Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Hi Andrea.  Thanks for your email.  Sorry I didn’t get back to you yesterday.  I had to go to Seattle (in other words I spent 
the day on I-5 and I-405).  Responses below, as well a question. 
Scott 
  
  
  

From: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ECY.WA.GOV>  
Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2022 8:19 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us>; Ghalambor, K <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
Importance: High 
  
Good morning Scott, 
Ken and I need your help to reconcile the “Future Use Unallocated Funds” projects & amounts identified in this first 
table (from September 2021) with the second & third tables in your more recent memo (from May 2022). OK 
  
Has the Flood Authority prioritized its requests yet for additional 21-23 “unallocated reserve” funds from the Chehalis 
Basin Board? Which of the project ideas in your May memo do you expect to be asking for Board funding at the July 
Board meeting?  Projects have not been prioritized yet per se.  We have ideas.  Knowing now that this will be on the 
agenda for July CBB I will work with Projects Committee and Executive Committee to prioritize. 
  
As I know you can appreciate, the Board’s budgeting process is getting increasingly complicated. To assist in better 
organizing/evaluating the growing number of requests OCB’s been getting for the reserved funds – and to help 
differentiate them from the new 23-25 requests that are also beginning to emerge – I’m needing to ask folks to submit 
information about “reserve funds” requests using this new attached standardized format. It’s short, but collects all the 
basic relevant information, and will ensure a comparable level of detail among all requests, so that OCB Staff can 
develop options and recommendations for the Board. It will also allow Board members to review comparable 
information in advance of the July 7 meeting where the Board is scheduled to make some decisions about use of the 21-
23 reserve funding.  YES, we will use the attachment.  Makes sense.  Question – If you need “in advance of July 7 
meeting,” when would that be? 
  
From Sept 2021: 
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From May 2022 

 
  
I know Ken has been trying to help collect all the requests from multiple sources, and you may have already given him 
some of this information. I apologize if this seems redundant, but I desperately need some better management tools at 
this point and appreciate your help transitioning to this new form. 
  
~Andrea 
Andrea McNamara Doyle (she/her) 
Director | Office of Chehalis Basin 
Mobile: 360.480.8564  |  Email: andrea.doyle@ecy.wa.gov 
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This communication is a public record and may be subject to disclosure as per the Washington State Public Records Act, RCW 42.56. 
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Scott Boettcher

From: Scott Boettcher
Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 7:40 AM
To: Ken Ghalambor
Cc: VRaines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us; Andrea McNamara Doyle
Subject: Forms For you -------- RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 

"Reserve" Funds
Attachments: Cosmopolis Mill Creek 7-06-2022 -- REQUEST FOR RESERVE 21-23 BUDGET FUNDS.pdf; Centralia 

New China Creek Gage 7-06-2022 -- REQUEST FOR RESERVE 21-23 BUDGET FUNDS.pdf; Port of 
Chehalis Berwick Creek 7-06-2022 -- REQUEST FOR RESERVE 21-23 BUDGET FUNDS.pdf; Centralia 
China Creek 7-06-2022 -- REQUEST FOR RESERVE 21-23 BUDGET FUNDS.pdf

Importance: High

Ken – Attached are 4 forms for you.  Just got some outstanding information for the Haul Road request form.  I’ll have 
that last form to you shortly.  Table 1 tallies Flood Authority funding request.  I did not include $75K for 2017 Basin Gage 
Master Plan update as I understood from you that that would be funded through OCB request.  Correct? 
Scott 
 

Table 1 

Immediate Funding (7/07/2022 CBB Request) 

Sponsor  Project  Request  Complete 
Project By 
June 30, 
2023 

Payback 
Project 
and/or 
Make Whole 

Finish, 
Complete, 
Close Project 
(or Distinct 
Phase) 

Centralia  China Creek Floodwater 
Storage and Fish Habitat 
Project 

$        643,000  

Yes  Yes  Yes 

Cosmopolis  Mill Creek Multi‐
Objective 
Implementation Plan, 
Phase II 

$          25,000  

Yes  n/a  Yes 

Flood Authority  New China Creek Gage  $           35,000   Yes  n/a  Yes 

Port of Chehalis  Berwick Creek Flood 
Reduction and 
Restoration 

$           89,257  
No  Yes  No 

Port of Grays 
Harbor 

Haul Road Immediate 
Protection Project 

$       400,000  
Yes  n/a  Yes 

      $     1,192,257           

 
 

From: Scott Boettcher  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:09 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: VRaines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us; Andrea McNamara Doyle <Andrea.Doyle@ecy.wa.gov> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
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Sending again.  See attached. 
 

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:07 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
I didn’t see a summary from you this morning, please send. And first thing tomorrow morning would be great for the 
attachments. Thanks 
 

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:02 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Its going to be first thing in a.m. tomorrow.  I have evening flood Authority meeting in Pe Ell.  Was my summary I sent 
you this morning helpful.  I’m sorry if I’m a bottle neck. 
Scott 
 

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 4:00 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Hi Scott, we’re still waiting on your write-ups on the attachments for the 21-23 reserve funds for the Haul Road project 
and 3 Flood Authority projects. We can’t send the memo to the Board until we have those. Please let us know when 
we’ll get them.  
 
Thanks, 
Ken 
 

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 2:32 PM 
To: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov>; Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: Re: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
 
Getting close.  Probably tomorrow. 

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 
 

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 2:17:17 PM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds  
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Thanks. Did you get a final budget estimate on the Haul Road project needs too? 
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 12:11 PM 
To: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Ken – Projects Committee met today and has developed a recommendation for the Flood Authority’s Executive 
Committee.  Following Executive committee review and approval, I’ll transmit formal request to OCB.  I’m trying to get 
all wrapped by end of this week. 
Scott 
  

From: Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 11:40 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>; McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Hi Scott, 
  
It would be best to get the attachment back by early next week; the goal is to have something together at least a week 
in advance of the meeting on the 7th. 
  
Thanks, 
Ken 
  
  

From: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 24, 2022 8:34 AM 
To: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ecy.wa.gov> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us>; Ken Ghalambor <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: RE: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
  
Hi Andrea.  Thanks for your email.  Sorry I didn’t get back to you yesterday.  I had to go to Seattle (in other words I spent 
the day on I-5 and I-405).  Responses below, as well a question. 
Scott 
  
  
  

From: McNamara Doyle, Andrea (ECY) <mcma461@ECY.WA.GOV>  
Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2022 8:19 AM 
To: Scott Boettcher <scottb@sbgh-partners.com> 
Cc: Raines, Vickie <vraines@co.grays-harbor.wa.us>; Ghalambor, K <kghalambor@rossstrategic.com> 
Subject: Flood Authority Priorities for Requesting Chehalis Basin Board 21-23 "Reserve" Funds 
Importance: High 
  
Good morning Scott, 
Ken and I need your help to reconcile the “Future Use Unallocated Funds” projects & amounts identified in this first 
table (from September 2021) with the second & third tables in your more recent memo (from May 2022). OK 
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Has the Flood Authority prioritized its requests yet for additional 21-23 “unallocated reserve” funds from the Chehalis 
Basin Board? Which of the project ideas in your May memo do you expect to be asking for Board funding at the July 
Board meeting?  Projects have not been prioritized yet per se.  We have ideas.  Knowing now that this will be on the 
agenda for July CBB I will work with Projects Committee and Executive Committee to prioritize. 
  
As I know you can appreciate, the Board’s budgeting process is getting increasingly complicated. To assist in better 
organizing/evaluating the growing number of requests OCB’s been getting for the reserved funds – and to help 
differentiate them from the new 23-25 requests that are also beginning to emerge – I’m needing to ask folks to submit 
information about “reserve funds” requests using this new attached standardized format. It’s short, but collects all the 
basic relevant information, and will ensure a comparable level of detail among all requests, so that OCB Staff can 
develop options and recommendations for the Board. It will also allow Board members to review comparable 
information in advance of the July 7 meeting where the Board is scheduled to make some decisions about use of the 21-
23 reserve funding.  YES, we will use the attachment.  Makes sense.  Question – If you need “in advance of July 7 
meeting,” when would that be? 
  
From Sept 2021: 

 
  
From May 2022 
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I know Ken has been trying to help collect all the requests from multiple sources, and you may have already given him 
some of this information. I apologize if this seems redundant, but I desperately need some better management tools at 
this point and appreciate your help transitioning to this new form. 
  
~Andrea 
Andrea McNamara Doyle (she/her) 
Director | Office of Chehalis Basin 
Mobile: 360.480.8564  |  Email: andrea.doyle@ecy.wa.gov 

 
This communication is a public record and may be subject to disclosure as per the Washington State Public Records Act, RCW 42.56. 
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